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It has been a week since I left Japan.  I met my host mother on the 23rd.  On the first day, I was
very nervous.  But I was used to staying here a little.  My host mother is very kind and cooks
very well.  We’ll have an activity this Saturday.  I want to enjoy classes and activities.  And I’ll do
my best!

Sayumi OKUDA

Hello!  One week has passed since I left Japan for New Zealand.  I'm not used to how to go to
school and go back home yet.  So I'm worried.  But I'm enjoying school, and my host family is
very kind.  So don't worry.  I'll do my best to be able to get to be more close friend with my host
family.
See you!

Aoi TAICHI

It has been a week since I came to New Zealand.  But I haven't got used to the life in New
Zealand yet.  So I got lost.  When I got lost and asked a man, I couldn't speak English very well.
So he couldn't understand what I want to say.  But I tried to tell him it so he listened to me
without bothering me.  From such a thing, I realized that New Zealanders are kind.

Kanon NODA

I came to New Zealand and I was worried about a lot of things, but the first week is finally over.
I am getting used thanks to the support of the family and I am getting a little more enjoyable.  I
am looking forward to sightseeing on Saturday.  I will do my best for about three more weeks in
New Zealand.

Haru ITO

I have been in New Zealand for one week.  I got used to living in New Zealand, but I have many
uneasiness.  It is to speak English with my family.  We don`t sometimes understand each other.
At  first  I  got lost,  but now I can go home and come to school by myself.   New Zealand is
different from Japan.  Finally, I really want to enjoy New Zealand.

Naoto KATSUMATA

A week has passed since I arrived in New Zealand.  My host family is kind and friendly, so I'm
happy.  I had the placement test on July 24.  The placement test includes writing, listening, and
speaking.  I joined Konko 1 group.  In the class, the students must not speak Japanese.  From
now, I want to do my best to make studying abroad the treasure in my life.

Tomoki OKAWA

I was able to arrive in New Zealand about a week ago.  When I saw my host family, I was very
nervous.  But they are kind enough for me to speak English slowly.  I am not nervous anymore.
I am very happy.  It is fun to be with my host family very much.  Dinner is very delicious.  I will
enjoy myself more than before.

Yuma KAKUHASHI

Hello from Auckland!  I enjoy the life here.  When I went to my host family’s house for the first
time, three families were waiting for me!.  I did not know what to do, but now I understand little
by little.  There are lots of scenery not found in Japan.  And everyday is full of excitement.  I
decided to try my best from now on, too.

Makana KUSAO

Hello.  My name is Yuya.  I am now in New Zealand, and I live with my host family.  The life in
NZ is very difficult for me, because I’m not good at English.  But it's very fun.  My study abroad
has just begun.  I will do my best to study English so that I can speak more freely.

Yuya KUBOTA


